
      
   

EXTERNAL 

Healthcare Applications Policy 
 

 

 

Nexeo Plastics, LLC and its subsidiaries and affiliates (Nexeo Plastics) distribute plastics 
products (Materials).  This policy applies to the sale of Materials for use in “healthcare 
applications.” We define Healthcare Applications as: “Incorporation of any Material in 
products intended for use in the diagnosis, cure, mitigation, treatment or prevention of 
disease or intended to affect the structure, appearance or any function of the human body.” 
In general, the term Healthcare Applications includes, but is not limited to, drugs (including 
both prescription and over-the-counter drugs) and products regulated as Class I, II or III 
medical devices (including packaging) by the US Food and Drug Administration, including 
injectable materials used in cosmetic or other medical procedures.   
 
Nexeo Plastics does not sell or provide samples of Materials or technical support for 
certain drugs or Class I, Class II and Class III medical devices, including injectable 
applications.  Therefore, all potential or known Healthcare Applications must be 
reviewed by Nexeo Plastics’ personnel pursuant to Nexeo Plastics’ Healthcare 
Applications Pre-Screening Procedure.  
 

POLICY 

 

Prior to placing an order with Nexeo Plastics, each customer considering using any Materials 
supplied or distributed by Nexeo Plastics in what is known to be or is potentially a Healthcare 
Application as defined above must: (1) notify Nexeo Plastics’ personnel; (2) acknowledge 
receipt and understanding of Nexeo Plastics’ Healthcare Applications Policy, and (3) 
complete Nexeo Plastics’ Healthcare Applications Pre-Screening Form or Nexeo Plastics’ 
Healthcare Applications Policy Acknowledgement Form, as applicable, in addition to any 
documents required by Nexeo Plastics’ suppliers. Nexeo Plastics retains the right to decline 
to supply any Material for any reason. 
 

DISCLAIMER 

 

The Materials supplied by Nexeo Plastics are designed and manufactured by other 
companies for various industries and applications.  Nexeo Plastics does not manufacture 
any Materials and does not warrant the suitability or efficacy of the Materials that we supply 
for healthcare or any other applications.  The warranty provided by Nexeo Plastics is limited 
to the warranty set forth in Nexeo Plastics’ terms and conditions of sale.  
 

 

ACKNOWLEDGEMENT OF NEXEO PLASTICS’ POLICY CONCERNING MATERIALS 

USED FOR HEALTHCARE APPLICATIONS  

 

By purchasing Materials from Nexeo Plastics for use in Healthcare Applications, customer 
acknowledges receipt and understanding of Nexeo Plastics’ Healthcare Applications Policy 
and confirms that customer has made, and will continue to make, its own independent 
evaluation and judgment concerning the safety and efficacy of the Materials for use in 
healthcare or other applications.  Customer also acknowledges that all sales of any Materials 
made pursuant to this policy shall be exclusively governed by the terms set out at 
www.nexeoplastics.com/sales-terms.  These terms supersede all terms of customer’s 
purchase order, acknowledgement or other document related to the sale of the Materials. 

http://www.nexeoplastics.com/sales-terms

